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On 11 October 2016 at I 0:51 , <lynn@sigservices.com.au> wrote: 

Hi Mathew, 

I received a call from Kerem Akkan this morning and from his sayings, STG needs to pay 
Kerem any hours that 's beyond 96H per week. For last week, he worked I 00 hours which 
means STG needs to pay 4 hours to him, however we didn ' t include that in last week invoice. 
Would you please advise that? 

Regards, 

Sue 

Accounting Assistant 
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